



Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
Fax 608-252-9243
Tel. 608-255-8891

To: WISCONSIN CENTRAL GROUP
C/O WCG STEERING COMMITTEE
DEWITT ROSS & STEVENS, S.C.
2 E. MIFFLIN STREET, SUITE 600
MADISON, WI 53703

Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000

Re: CANADIAN NATIONAL RAILWAY COMPANY

To Professional Services

		Rate	Hours	Amount
	John Duncan Varda			
06-01-10	NO CHARGE - Edit and re-write Beaupre and Adams letter, work on re-stating WCGroup objectives	0	3.25	0.00
06-01-10	NO CHARGE - Draft WCG introduction letter, E. Burkhardt	0	1.25	0.00
06-05-10	NO CHARGE - Draft letterhead statement to "goal" and do layout of topics for WCG home	0	1.50	0.00
06-07-10	NO CHARGE - Edit WisDOT letters; consider distribution	0	0.70	0.00
06-08-10	NO CHARGE - Review website problems; begin work on re-working material for website	0	1.50	0.00
06-09-10	NO CHARGE - Forward email versions of letters to R. Adams regarding update and disclosures	0	1.50	0.00
06-09-10	NO CHARGE - Courtesy response from Attorney Chung, WisDOT	0	0.10	0.00
06-10-10	NO CHARGE - Development work on conversion of materials for website; forward to Jessica M. Pech for proof and edit	0	2.25	0.00
06-10-10	NO CHARGE - Review WPC draft litigation update memorandum; respond to Attorney Palmer	0	0.20	0.00
06-10-10	NO CHARGE - Prepare agenda for consultation meeting with B. Solberg, website development (time prorated)	0	0.25	0.00
06-11-10	NO CHARGE - Consultation with B. Solberg, Sara Campbell and Jessica M. Pech regarding website development alternatives and objectives and pay B. Solberg (time prorated)	0	0.90	0.00
06-11-10	NO CHARGE - Complete second route edits on WPG Home page items, add printable summary; review and forward Antitrust Guidelines and Summary to assistant for proof and edit; discussion with project assistant regarding website items	0	0.70	0.00
06-15-10	Update Antitrust Guidelines and Summary updates to website; work on Stakeholders network template and related	0	4.50	0.00



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS**
LAW FIRM

Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 2

Capitol Square Office
Two East Millin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
Fax 608-252-9243
Tel. 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
06-21-10	Draft web and promo piece regarding "Our Preferred Solution - Give Competition a Chance"	0	1.00	0.00
06-21-10	Check with Sara Campbell regarding Antitrust Summary and Guidelines postings; re-write posting on Alternative STB Action; complete and forward to Sara Campbell for posting on website	0	2.50	0.00
06-22-10	Forward postings to Jessica M. Pech for proof/edits, more	0	0.20	0.00
06-23-10	NO CHARGE - Review edits and comments from Jessica M. Pech on letterhead and web posting (time prorated)	0	0.20	0.00
06-28-10	Rework web posts for Preferred Option, Alternative and Goal (time prorated)	0	0.60	0.00
07-08-10	Complete topic outline for Pirlot, Landin and Korpi email on start-up	0	0.45	0.00
07-14-10	Complete and forward strategy memorandum to R. J. Pirlot, J. Landin and Kevin Korpi, copy Attorney Palmer	0	1.50	0.00
07-15-10	Comments from J. Landin regarding proposed agenda	0	0.15	0.00
07-16-10	Review R. Adams response to information request on Canadian National; circulate copy and comments to R. J. Pirlot, J. Landin and K. Korpi	0	0.70	0.00
07-19-10	Confirm meeting with J. Landin and R. J. Pirlot for 7/22/2010	0	0.15	0.00
07-25-10	Print outs for meetings with L. Ogard and WisDOT	0	0.40	0.00
07-26-10	Contact with K. Korpi regarding status, meeting setup, conferencing with L. Ogard; at WisDOT conference with L. Ogard, M. Hart and S. Beaupre regarding State Rail Plan 2030, private sector objectives, various obstacles (time prorated)	0	2.25	0.00
08-06-10	Respond to Attorney Palmer with update for WPC Litigation Committee; email exchange with L. Ogard regarding WCGroup informational session at LSSA meeting, Green Bay, early September (time prorated)	0	0.30	0.00
09-16-10	Respond to Attorney Palmer regarding no developments	0	0.10	0.00
09-17-10	Email Attorney Palmer regarding update on status for Wis Paper Council Litigation Committee report; telephone conference with Attorney Palmer regarding same and Mercury Group developments, advice regarding Great Lakes Legal Foundation inroads	0	0.65	0.00
10-22-10	Forward project memo to CJS regarding address book updates for WCGroup participation	0	0.35	0.00
10-26-10	Review STB notice regarding exemptions, review AF&PA invitation for conference call, consider options, approach	0	0.75	0.00
11-01-10	Consider approach to Comments on effectiveness of exemptions, STB EP 704	0	0.35	0.00
11-10-10	Respond to K. Hager, City of New London, regarding Wolf River contact, Mark Christopher	0	0.20	0.00



Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 3

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
Fax 608-252-9243
Tel. 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
11-11-10	Telephone call from Attorney R. Kuehn regarding Blue Line Coalition, schedule meeting, Dean Zuleger connection	0	0.25	0.00
11-15-10	Connect with Attorney R. Kuehn on scheduling meeting with Dean Zulegar, Blue Line Coalition; print out WCGroup materials for meeting; search and printout EJ&E materials, bookmarks regarding same	0	2.50	0.00
11-16-10	Meet with Dean Zuleger and Attorney R. Kuehn regarding Blue Line Coalition, share handouts, discussion regarding organization	0	1.35	0.00
11-17-10	Download WI railmap, instructions on printing and delivery to Attorney R. Kuehn and file	0	0.20	0.00
11-22-10	Telephone call to K. Korpi regarding background on WI developments and potential for facilitating connection with Governor-elect Snyder; forward Dept. of Agriculture article	0	0.35	0.00
11-23-10	Track biofuels projects for WCGroup promotion; contacts with Attorney Palmer and Attorney Speerschneider; exchange with Bruce Ridley regarding potential assistance on EP704 comments; telephone call to Attorney R. Kuehn regarding Michigan connections, 3M information from D. Zulegar on Scott Mosher; research reading; respond to Attorney DiTullio marketing query regarding "high speed rail" and warning regarding no comments from Firm (copy Attorney R. Kuehn); consider mailing list and timing problems, orderly approach to soliciting subscriptions	0	2.10	0.00
12-01-10	Exchanges regarding scheduling Steering Committee; email Attorney R. Kuehn regarding Blue Line status; office conference with Attorney R. Kuehn regarding status of Blue Line and related; exchanges with B. Ridley, PCA regarding scope of WCGroup project	0	0.65	0.00
01-09-11	Sort out materials to use at PCA meeting	0	0.60	0.00
01-18-11	NO CHARGE - EP 704: Edit Statement and cover letter; forward for proof reading	0	2.60	0.00
01-24-11	Edit and print final comments, cover letter and oral hearing request; spot review of WC annual reports	0	1.75	0.00
01-25-11	At DeWitt, sign off on WI Central Group STB EP 704, discussion with M. Olson regarding website and follow-up (time prorated); markup changes to website, email memo to M. Olson regarding same	0	0.70	0.00
01-26-11	Email with assistant regarding WI Central Group Stakeholders Network setup	0	0.20	0.00
01-26-11	Forward WI Central Group Stakeholder Network Introductions, work on contact list updates, exchanges with assistant	0	2.75	0.00
01-27-11	Email responses, K Hager at New London and from Mark Christopher, Wolf River	0	0.15	0.00



Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 4

Capitol Square Office
Two East Millin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
Fax 608-252-9243
Tel. 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
01-31-11	Forward WI Central Group EP 704 statement and notice to S. Madden at AF&PA	0	0.25	0.00
02-01-11	STB EP 705: Review Notice; outline notes for comment statement; assemble first draft	0	4.25	0.00
02-02-11	STB EP 705: Work through Drafts 2 and 3 of statement	0	3.80	0.00
02-02-11	Stakeholder Network Introduction: Respond to R. Harding	0	0.10	0.00
02-03-11	STB EP 705: complete Draft 4 of initial statement and forward for proofreading	0	1.70	0.00
02-04-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Advice regarding date change (time prorated)	0	0.10	0.00
02-07-11	Prepare draft agenda for initial meeting of Steering Committee; forward draft to R.J. Pirlot, K. Korpi, J. Landing, and Attorneys Palmer and R. Kuehn; prepare printouts for WPC Litigation Committee meeting	0	1.50	0.00
02-08-11	NO CHARGE - Attend WPC Litigation Committee, report on status and WCG Steering Committee; advice to K. Korpi regarding WCG Steering Committee; follow-up with Attorney Palmer regarding status (time prorated)	0	1.50	0.00
02-08-11	Letter to Attorney cooper, NewPage, regarding participations and funding	0	1.25	0.00
02-09-11	Draft and forward WI Central Group Steering Committee letter to Attorney Cooper, New Page	0	1.10	0.00
02-15-11	Email exchanges and preparation of printouts, notes for initial Steering Committee conference call meeting	0	1.25	0.00
02-15-11	STB EP 704: Review hearing order, consider implications (time prorated)	0	0.25	0.00
02-15-11	Renew website domain name registrations	0	0.75	0.00
02-15-11	Initial Steering Committee Meeting (conference call): R. J. Pirlot, WMC; J. Landing, WPC; C. Timm, Domtar; M. Robbins, Wausau Papers; B. Ridley, Packaging Corp. of America	0	1.10	0.00
02-15-11	Preliminary email notice, next meeting of Steering Committee and update	0	0.45	0.00
02-17-11	STB EP704: Begin review of statements of other witnesses (time prorated)	0	0.30	0.00
02-18-11	Email memorandum to M. Bromley, Badger CURE, regarding shifting message to include failure of Class Is to compete for non-captive traffic (copy B. Ridley, et al)	0	0.80	0.00
02-20-11	STB EP 704: Hearing preparation, download and review statements of others, notes (time prorated)	0	0.75	0.00
02-21-11	STB EP 704: Hearing preparation, further readings in statements of others (time prorated)	0	0.60	0.00
02-23-11	Travel Madison to Washington D.C. (time prorated)	0	0.20	0.00
02-24-11	At STB EP 704 hearing, presentation for WI Central Group, audit other testimony (time prorated)	0	3.50	0.00



Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 5

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
Fax 608-252-9243
Tel 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
02-25-11	Travel Washington D.C. to Madison, enroute review hearing notes, notes for follow up (time prorated)	0	2.25	0.00
02-26-11	Check for EP 704 transcript, follow up note regarding "The Resourceful Popcorn Guy," review ASLRRRA statement and appendix, notes (time prorated)	0	0.50	0.00
02-27-11	Draft Steering Committee agenda; memo to R. J. Pirlot, J. Landin and K. Korpi; follow up to K. Korpi	0	0.85	0.00
03-03-11	Preparation and Steering Committee conference call with R.J. Pirlot, J. Landin, M. Robbins of Wausau Papers, C. Timm of Domtar and M. Graceffa of Bemis	0	3.50	0.00
03-04-11	Telephone tag with B. Ridley, Packaging Corp.	0	0.20	0.00
03-14-11	Email exchange with G. Clark, New Page, re CN status	0	0.20	0.00
03-16-11	Respond to WMC regarding Steering Committee scheduling, arrangements	0	0.10	0.00
03-17-11	Draft Steering Committee 3/22/2011 agenda; draft CEO invitation letter, attachment and instructions; forward same via email to Steering Committee plus EP 705 draft filing and Subscription Agreement and Remittance forms; forward invitation to New Page to participate or audit conference call; exchanges with R. J. Pirlot regarding scheduling WI Dept. of Transportation staff contact meeting	0	4.20	0.00
03-17-11	Review and forward article on decision upholding STB CN/EJ&E mitigation	0	0.45	0.00
03-17-11	Review articles on Prince Rupert and Court decision upholding STB on EJ&E mitigation requirement; forward "alert" to Wisconsin Central Group Steer Committee, NewPage and WI Dept. of Transportation staff contacts	0	0.60	0.00
03-18-11	Exchanges with WI Dept. of Transportation Attorney Chung; print out STB CN/EJ&E decision	0	0.30	0.00
03-21-11	Assemble document copies for Steering Committee meeting	0	0.20	0.00
03-22-11	Further follow-up with Attorney R. Kuehn regarding WisDOT Secretary meeting, Blue Line Coalition, addition of Mayor of Wisconsin Rapids to Blue Line Steering Committee	0	0.20	0.00
03-22-11	Quick review Transport Canada "Rail Service Review - Final Report" and circulate comments to NewPage, WCG Steering Committee and WisDOT staff	0	0.85	0.00
03-22-11	At WMC, WCG Steering Committee conference call, redirection on CEO level invitation; follow-up with RJ Pirlot regarding assignments; related travel; note to B. Ridley regarding support for Tisa-Kachroo contacts; status report notes to NewPage and to Craig Timm and Jeff Landin	0	2.15	0.00
03-23-11	Telephone conference with B. Ridley regarding comments on EP 705 draft Comments	0	0.40	0.00



Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 6

Capitol Square Office
Two East Millin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
FAX 608-252-9243
Tel. 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
03-24-11	STB EP 705: Update draft comments; review Canadian service study for quotes; review STB EP 704 streaming video, 2/24/2011 hearing	0	2.25	0.00
03-25-11	Review CN meeting email from B. Ridley; respond with suggestions and recommendations, circulate to Steering Committee; advice from M. Robbins, Wausau papers regarding same	0	1.25	0.00
03-28-11	Notice from Attorney R. Kuehn regarding change of meeting date, WI Dept. of Transportation Secretary; comments to Attorney R. Kuehn regarding use of information	0	0.35	0.00
03-29-11	Edit draft of Wi Central Group STB EP 705 Initial Comments; forward to Steering Committee; forward to G. Clark, et al, at NewPage; forward to Attorney Chung and staff at WI Dept. of Transportation; check; email exchanges, R. J. Pirlot regarding attending WI Dept. of Transportation meeting	0	2.75	0.00
03-29-11	Email exchange with B. Ridley regarding Word copy of STB EP 705 draft, T. Tisa contact; agenda for CN meeting	0	0.30	0.00
03-30-11	Respond to B. Ridley regarding CN meeting date, participants, firming up WI Central Group Steering Committee and related; email C. Timm regarding K. Korpi and MFPC	0	0.60	0.00
04-02-11	Draft talking points for meeting with WI Department of Transportation	0	0.50	0.00
04-03-11	STB EP 705: Set up cover letter for filing (time prorated)	0	0.20	0.00
04-05-11	STB EP 705: Forward cover letter and instructions regarding preparation for filing (time prorated)	0	0.10	0.00
04-06-11	Complete Agenda for Steering Committee, Counsel's task list, update potential participant list	0	2.50	0.00
04-06-11	STB EP 705: Complete final of Initial Comments; sign pleading	0	1.80	0.00
04-07-11	Review CN organizational chart, T. Tisa perspective	0	0.20	0.00
04-07-11	Note to G. Clark, NewPage	0	0.20	0.00
04-08-11	STB EP 705: Sign off and file Initial Comments	0	0.20	0.00
04-08-11	Messages from Attorney Chung and R. Adams regarding WCL merger DM&I and DW&P	0	0.40	0.00
04-08-11	Steering Committee conference call at WMC; preparation and follow up discussion with R. J. Pirlot regarding Public Service Commission involvement in Wisconsin rail issues (time prorated)	0	1.50	0.00
04-08-11	Review Joint Initial Comments draft STB EP 705, CURE et al.	0	0.50	0.00
04-13-11	STB FD 35476: Read notice; research rules and statute; consider potential use for WCGroup issue leverage	0	1.50	0.00



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS**
LAW FIRM

Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 7

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
Fax 608-252-9243
Tel 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
04-14-11	At Wis. Dept. of Transportation, conference with Secretary Gottlieb, Deputy Secretary Berg, D. Zulegar and Attorney R. Kuehn; related travel, review advance agenda, pre-meeting discussion and related (time prorated)	0	1.20	0.00
04-15-11	Respond to B. Ridley, copy Steering Committee, regarding draft agenda for meeting with Canadian National (tentative for 6/7/2011)	0	0.80	0.00
04-17-11	Draft funding memo to Attorney R. Kuehn for Wis. Dept. of Transportation (time prorated)	0	0.75	0.00
04-18-11	Update draft of memo on Wis. Dept. of Transportation funding (time prorated)	0	0.85	0.00
04-19-11	Draft Steering Committee agenda, edit website home page; convert "Preferred Solution" into "Our Goal, Mr. Tellier's Plan"; upgrade tasks checklist; contact WMC regarding teleconference setup; forward meeting notice	0	1.60	0.00
04-19-11	Forward Steering Committee materials to Attorney Cooper and G. Clark, A. Gould at NewPage; note regarding "Our Goal, Mr. Tellier's Plan" to E. Burkhardt and review response	0	1.20	0.00
04-19-11	Forward Stakeholder Network invitation to M. Robbins contacts (West Fraser Pulp, Alpac Forest Products, and Canfor Pulp Products); instructions to M. Olson	0	0.60	0.00
04-20-11	Read E. Burkhardt's statement in EP 705	0	0.35	0.00
04-20-11	Respond to E. Burkhardt regarding "Mr. Tellier's Plan" and regarding WI Central Group EP 704 and EP 705 filings; email Quick Update to Steering Committee	0	0.30	0.00
04-20-11	NO CHARGE - Update website material, forward for uploading	0	1.00	0.00
04-25-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Skimming through selected railroad initial comments for potential reply topics (time prorated)	0	0.50	0.00
04-25-11	NO CHARGE - Reminder email to Steering Committee; assemble materials for Steering Committee Conference call; check website updating; note to M. Olson regarding correcting EP 705 notice link	0	1.20	0.00
04-25-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Formulate recommendation to the Steering Committee	0	0.35	0.00
04-26-11	NO CHARGE - Final preparation for Steering Committee conference call; related travel	0	1.10	0.00
04-26-11	NO CHARGE - Steering Committee conference call at WMC with B. Ridley, C. Timm, J. Landin, M. Robbins	0	1.10	0.00
04-26-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Further review of AAR and ASLRRRA initial comments, "capacity" issue research, review Cambridge Systematics 2007 "capacity" report cited in AAR initial comments	0	1.65	0.00



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS**
LAW FIRM

Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 8

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
Fax 608-252-9243
Tel. 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
04-26-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Research U.S. Code and CFR provisions for Petition for Revocation of Exemption	0	1.45	0.00
04-27-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Review procedure and legal standard; draft Petition for Revocation of Exemption; forward for handling to final; forward attachments	0	3.20	0.00
04-27-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Re-check railroad Notice for references	0	0.30	0.00
04-27-11	NO CHARGE - Update task list, miscellaneous follow up on meeting assignments; quick update email to Steering Committee	0	1.25	0.00
04-27-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 35476: Review inquiry from Atty Chung, WisDOT, regarding filing complementary "comments," forward copy of WCGroup draft Petition with explanatory memo	0	0.55	0.00
04-28-11	NO CHARGE - Respond to inquiry from NewPage	0	0.85	0.00
04-28-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Telephone conference with Attorney Chung, Wis. Dept. of Transportation regarding Wis. Department of Transportation filing, background; email response to further inquiry	0	0.75	0.00
04-28-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Edit Petition per discussion with Attorney Chung; process forwarding	0	0.75	0.00
04-29-11	NO CHARGE - Multiple exchanges with B. Ridley regarding Canadian National contacts, meeting participants; exchanges with G. Clark, NewPage, regarding potential participation in 6/7/2011 meeting with CN	0	0.70	0.00
04-29-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Advice regarding filing fee and service questions; quick check on procedural rules and Federal Register Notice of Exemption	0	0.25	0.00
04-30-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Further check on filing rules, print out rules, preparation for STB contact	0	0.60	0.00
05-02-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Correct filing fee and service; related contacts	0	1.50	0.00
05-03-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Review Wis. Dept. of Transportation filing; respond to Attorney Chung regarding same	0	0.65	0.00
05-04-11	Review note from R. Adams regarding CN Potash, consideration of same	0	0.20	0.00
05-05-11	NO CHARGE - Stakeholder Network Update No. 1; Steering Committee Quick Update; instructions regarding posting FD 35476 documents on website; track down email problems with Stakeholder Network (partial); re-check service requirements for EP 704/705 type proceedings	0	2.25	0.00



Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 9

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
Fax 608-252-9243
Tel. 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
05-09-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Review docket per Attorney Chung request; email memo to Atty Chung regarding correcting filing and suggestion of participation in EP 705	0	0.50	0.00
05-10-11	Memo to R. Adams, WisDOT, comments on CN "potash" train article, contrast to WI needs; quick update to Steering Committee; contact K. Muhlke, WMC, regarding facilities for WCG Steering Committee conference call	0	1.25	0.00
05-11-11	NO CHARGE - Forward Steering Committee reminder to NewPage	0	0.05	0.00
05-11-11	Forward Steering Committee Quick Update to NewPage; email to R. Adams and Attorney Chung, WisDOT, article on CN investment in expanded capacity in Canada for Prince Rupert and related traffic, highlight lack of information on attention to WC lines	0	0.40	0.00
05-15-11	Prepare and forward to Attorney Handzel "May 2011 Update" for WPC Litigation Committee	0	0.80	0.00
05-16-11	Prepare and forward to Attorney Handzel, summary of Litigation Committee updates April 2010 through February 2011; further editing and forward per Attorney Handzel request	0	1.25	0.00
05-19-11	Extended work on "Possible Responses" for meeting with CN; prepare and forward Steering Committee Agenda and attachments	0	3.50	0.00
05-20-11	Work through "themes" for Steering Committee discussion; correct notice to Steering Committee; forward with correction of Steering Committee notice; advice from M. Graceffa regarding non-attendance	0	2.25	0.00
05-20-11	Update from Attorney R. Kuehn regarding transportation budget	0	0.10	0.00
05-23-11	NO CHARGE - Confirm conference call arrangement with WMC	0	0.10	0.00
05-23-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Review CN's reply; update note to Steering Committee and NewPage; cancellation from C. Timm	0	0.80	0.00
05-23-11	NO CHARGE - Print out agenda and memos for Steering Committee conference call	0	0.15	0.00
05-24-11	NO CHARGE - Preparation for Steering Committee conference call; at WMC, Steering Committee conference call; related travel	0	1.40	0.00
05-25-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Close reading of CN's Reply; review procedural rules; prepare Motion to Dismiss; forward "Quick Update" to Steering Committee; file motion	0	3.75	0.00



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS**
LAW FIRM

Date: July 21, 2011
 Invoice: 916394
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 10

Capitol Square Office
 Two East Mifflin Street
 Suite 600
 Madison, WI 53703-2865
 FAX 608-252-9243
 TEL 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
05-25-11	NO CHARGE - Square away and respond to A. Gould, confirming invitation to attend June 7, 2011 meeting with CN	0	0.35	0.00
05-26-11	Forward analysis of CN FD 35476 Reply, etc., to R. Adams and Attorney Chung; forward courtesy copies of pleading and cover letter via email to T. Litwiler, CN	0	0.40	0.00
05-27-11	NO CHARGE - STP EP 705: begin reviewing reply filings for comments on WCG Initial Comments (time prorated); forward copy of WisDOT email to Steering Committee, quick update	0	0.35	0.00
05-31-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Spot check Reply filings (time prorated)	0	0.50	0.00
06-02-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Draft transmittal letter; organize approach, markup testimony document	0	1.45	0.00
06-03-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Two further iterations of draft Testimony; instruction for proofing and editing; draft Quick Update to Steering Committee	0	2.10	0.00
06-06-11	NO CHARGE - Assemble materials for meeting with Canadian National, draft confidentiality document, antitrust guidelines and summary, agenda and other extra copies, directions	0	0.80	0.00
06-07-11	NO CHARGE - Meeting with Canadian National (Vee Kachroo, Kevin Soucie, Tom Tisa, John Klaus), with NewPage, Domtar, Wausau Papers, Wisconsin Paper Council, and Packaging Corporation of America; related travel	0	8.50	0.00
06-08-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Further edits to testimony; forward for filing	0	1.50	0.00
06-08-11	NO CHARGE - Exchanges with Attorney Chung and R. Adams, WisDOT; reports to various	0	0.45	0.00
06-09-11	NO CHARGE - Review Trains magazine article on STB regulatory review, mis-reporting WCG's position; respond to same and circulate response to Steering Committee; advice to E. Burkhardt, update and review response; advice to WisDOT regarding same	0	1.70	0.00
06-10-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Checking and spot reading filings by others, estimation of witness count, considering, planning travel (time prorated)	0	0.60	0.00
06-10-11	NO CHARGE - Forward EP 705 testimony to Matt Bromley, BadgerCURE	0	0.15	0.00



Date: July 21, 2011
Invoice: 916394
Client: 71729.000
Page: 11

Capitol Square Office
Two East Millin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
FAX 608-252-9243
TEL 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
06-13-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Message from Attorney Litwiler regarding problem with filing of the Motion to Dismiss; draft new electronic transmittal cover letter; instructions regarding re-filing and serving the Motion electronically; telephone conference (message) to Attorney Litwiler regarding status	0	0.50	0.00
06-14-11	NO CHARGE - STB FD 35476: Electronic re-filing of Motion to Dismiss; email copy to Attorney Litwiler	0	0.60	0.00
06-16-11	NO CHARGE - Email exchanges with assistant regarding tracking spreadsheet for WCG Stakeholder Network	0	0.30	0.00
06-17-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Review and analysis of hearing notice and scheduling assignments, check out Highroad Consulting (read testimony and reply comments) and Nevada Central, compare to order in EP 704 (time prorated)	0	0.75	0.00
06-17-11	NO CHARGE - Contact K. Soucie, Canadian National, regarding meeting in D.C.	0	0.15	0.00
06-19-11	NO CHARGE - Review contacts lists; generate email introductions; instructions to M. Olson	0	1.50	0.00
06-20-11	NO CHARGE - Email Steering Committee reminder; email exchange with C. Timm regarding scheduling; email K. Mahlkuch, WMC, regarding scheduling conference call; further discussion with assistant regarding Stakeholders Network contacts follow-up; telephone conference with A. Gould regarding scheduling and status of record keeping on service failures; forward note regarding CN earnings comparisons to Steering Committee; related	0	1.25	0.00
06-21-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Travel to Washington D.C. (time prorated)	0	1.00	0.00
06-21-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Review Testimony and Initial Comments	0	1.25	0.00
06-22-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: At STB, attend hearing, monitor testimony and notes (time prorated)	0	3.00	0.00
06-22-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Rewrite testimony	0	3.00	0.00
06-23-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: At STB, attend hearing and deliver WCGroup testimony, answer questions from Commissioner Mulvey and Vice Chair Begeman	0	3.00	0.00
06-23-11	NO CHARGE - Respond to Attorney R. Kuehn regarding Blue Line progress, query regarding what can be reported to WCGroup Steering Committee	0	0.10	0.00
06-23-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Travel to Madison (time prorated)	0	1.50	0.00
06-24-11	NO CHARGE - Telephone conference with B. Ridley regarding EP 705 hearing report, Chairman Elliott's agenda, travel to Tomahawk (time prorated)	0	0.10	0.00



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS^{sc}**
LAW FIRM

Date: July 21, 2011
 Invoice: 916394
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 12

Capitol Square Office
 Two East Mifflin Street
 Suite 600
 Madison, WI 53703-2865
 Fax 608-252-9243
 Tel. 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
06-26-11	NO CHARGE - At Mellen, WI, note lumber operators names and addresses for contacts, observe WC/CN trackage	0	0.25	0.00
06-27-11	NO CHARGE - Draft report on EP 705 hearing and testimony; struggle with "next steps" and preparation for Steering Committee; email exchange with B. Ridley regarding Congressman Ribble connection on Chairman Elliott's trip to Wisconsin	0	2.50	0.00
06-28-11	NO CHARGE - Notes for Steering Committee conference call; conference call; related travel	0	1.70	0.00
06-29-11	NO CHARGE - Check Prince Rupert and other capacity data.	0	0.35	0.00
06-30-11	NO CHARGE - Check Prince Rupert and other capacity data.	0	0.35	0.00
Total Current Professional Services		0	190.40	0.00
Total Current Services and Disbursements			0.00	
TOTAL DUE, PLEASE PAY THIS AMOUNT			0.00	
RE: CANADIAN NATIONAL RAILWAY				